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sharing new content at least twice a day will eventually
get you a massive following because it will improve the
exposure your videos are getting but you also have to
post videos at the right time the magic posting hours on
tiktok are between 11 am and 5 pm as your followers and
their friends are most likely to use the app in that time
frame get to know your audience and try to understand
how frequently and at which hours they re using the tiktok
app this will help you create a posting schedule that
minimizes the chances of posting videos during parts of
the day when they get the least amount of exposure
sharing new content at least twice a day will eventually
get you a massive following because it will improve the
exposure your videos are getting but you also have to
post videos at the right time the magic posting hours on
tiktok are between 11 am and 5 pm as your followers and
their friends are most likely to use the app in that time
frame get to know your audience and try to understand
how frequently and at which hours they re using the tiktok
app this will help you create a posting schedule that
minimizes the chances of posting videos during parts of
the day when they get the least amount of exposure find
your nicheidentify the type of content you enjoy creating
and that resonates with your audience whether it s
comedy dance educational or lifestyle videos consistency
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in your niche helps attract a dedicated follower base use
trending sounds and hashtagsstay updated with the latest
trends on tiktok using popular sounds and hashtags can
increase the visibility of your videos making them more
likely to appear on the for you page fyp focus on video
qualityinvest in good lighting and a decent camera to
improve the quality of your videos clear well lit videos are
more appealing and likely to be shared find your own
voice because everyone else s voice is already taken if
you try to imitate the content other creators produce you ll
never find your own distinctive style what s more the
viewers of your video can easily see if you re really
enjoying making the video or not and in many cases that
may be the reason why they decide to skip hitting the
follow button chose topics that you re passionate about
because if you re just following the trends the content you
produce may seem generic don t be afraid to think out of
the box and do something new every once in a while just
to see how your followers react more often than not you ll
discover something your fans adore and you ll attract new
followers that liked your eagerness to try out new things


