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financebuzz is an informational website that provides tips
advice and recommendations to help you make financial
decisions we strive to provide up to date information but
make no warranties regarding the accuracy of our
information ultimately you are responsible for your
financial decisions financebuzz is not a financial
institution and does not provide credit cards or any other
financial products financebuzz com does not make any
credit decisions congratulations on reaching the end of
our guide on scoring free amazon gift cards you ve
learned various savvy ways to bag those vouchers from
completing surveys to diving into online activities
remember the key is staying cautious of scams and
understanding how to redeem your rewards securely now
armed with these insights go forth and start racking up
those amazon goodies your wallet will thank you later ok
gat newi can attest to instagc being instant but the only
drawback is that once you hit 600 for the year you have to
give them your ssn before cashing out apparently for tax
purposes i ran into that issue this year while trying to save
for christmas so fair warning if you join up on instagc try
not to make more than 600 a year unless you want to
deal with getting a 1099 misc eligibility this program is
open to participants who are age 18 years or older at the
time of entry this program is not open to 1 employees or
internally contracted vendors of client or its parent
subsidiaries agents or affiliates 2 the immediate family
members or members of the same household of any such
employee or vendor 3 anyone professionally involved in
the development or administration of this program 4
employees or internally contracted vendors of
governments and government affiliated companies or
organizations or 5 any employee whose employer s
guidelines or regulations do not allow entry in the
program this program is open to residents of italy spain
norway finland sweden denmark kingdom of saudi arabia
united arab emirates south africa this program is void in
any other country and where otherwise prohibited or
restricted by law
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