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have you just tried claiming a monopoly go dice link and it
didn t work dice links can only be redeemed once per
monopoly go account so if you click on a link and get a
message that says this reward has already been claimed
then that means you ve redeemed the link previously
keep checking back though we are constantly updating
this page with the latest links aurora is a 4x expand
explore exploit and exterminate science fiction strategy
game players develop their interstellar empire from the
humble beginnings on their homeworld to conquer the
universe or be pummeled into the ashes of history by
opposing races participating in events special events
hosted by monopoly go offer additional opportunities to
earn free dice rolls active participation and reaching
milestones during events unlock valuable rewards if you
click on a dice link and it doesn t even open in monopoly
go then that s a different issue from our experience there
can sometimes be teething troubles when you try to open
a dice link on an android device when you click on a link
in your browser you should get a pop up menu asking you
to open in another app
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