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the good news for content creators is that there are plenty
of ways to monetize their tiktok content even if you don t
qualify to apply for the creator fund you can still find
several other options to make money on the platform so
all your efforts to build a following and create high quality
content consistently won t go to waste here are five
different ways to make money on tiktok now that you
have a fair idea of how much tiktok pays you re perhaps
curious to find out how much you can earn as a tiktok
influencer check out this free tiktok money calculator to
calculate your earning potential purchasing tiktok coins is
a straightforward process follow this simple instruction if
you want to learn how to gain tiktok coins 1 log into your
tiktok account and go to your profile 2 select the settings
icon in the top right corner of the screen 3 from the drop
down option that opens select my portfolio 4 select an
alternate quantity for the number of coins you wish to
acquire 5 on the following screen enter your payment
information you will be transported to the confirmation
page once you have selected your quantity you verify the
acquisition at this step same as you would with a card
touch id samsung payment or whatever method you use
once the transaction is complete the number of coins you
purchased will be added to the total amount in your tiktok
wallet account at this point you are free to use your coins
anyway you see fit and whenever you desire the current
value in us dollars is displayed together with the number
of coins you have selected however despite the
oscillations of the exchange classes this does not vary
significantly the tiktok coin concept proved to be more
difficult to explain in detail than i had anticipated when
you first enter into the tiktok application everything is quite
straightforward you purchase coins which you may then
swap for diamonds or emojis if you buy coins for the first
time while watching tiktok live content you get a welcome
pack this is a 0 99 package that provides 65 coins plus 45
extra an 80 discount on a unique gift and a badge that
appears next to your tiktok name for 24 hours
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